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MAY 8

The countdown to the September Mighty 
Giveback concert has begun! This is 
your chance to meet this year’s nonprofit 
partners and learn more about their focus 
on mental health.

JUNE 7

A “Pink Table Talk” about empowering 
women and nurturing wellness with NC 
Representative Julie von Haefen and 
Shirnetta Harrell of No Woman No Girl. 
Join the conversation and help complete 
an onsite service project.

bit.ly/DOA24

SEPTEMBER 21

Help us raise over $1 million for mental 
health in the Triangle, and hear amazing 
music. VIP and sponsorship packages are 
available.

bit.ly/MightyGiveback24

SEPTEMBER 24

Join us for a service project to benefit the 
community. More details to be announced.

bit.ly/Caring24       

APRIL 21-27

We’re partnering with PORCH, TABLE, 
The Food Bank of Central and Eastern 
NC, Inter-faith Food Shuttle, The Daniel 
Center for Math and Science and The 
Raleigh Boys & Girls Club to offer a week 
of volunteering opportunities!

JULY 24

A panel discussion featuring leaders 
from impactful nonprofits dedicated to 
advancing mental health initiatives. This is 
part of the leadup to the Mighty Giveback 
concert in September. More details to be 
announced.

bit.ly/MGconvo
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AUGUST 31

A wealth of resources... whether you’re 
seeking assistance, information, or simply 
eager to connect with local organizations 
making a difference, this event is your 
one-stop-shop for all things community 
support!

bit.ly/communityrodeo

COMMUNITY RESOURCE RODEO

MIGHTY GIVEBACK LAUNCH DAY OF ACTION
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AUGUST

Join us to get the latest information about 
your local United Way – who we are, what 
we do – and learn more about the value 
we add to the community.

More details to be announced.

THE STATE OF UNITED WAY

THE MIGHTY GIVEBACK CONCERT DAY OF CARING

NATIONAL VOLUNTEER WEEK

COMMUNITY CONVERSATION

Scan QR code to access 
more info and signup options!

If you have questions about engagement 
opportunities, contact Allyson Cobb.

updated 6.21.24

https://www.signupgenius.com/go/9040C4EABAA23A1FF2-45290079-dayofaction?useFullSite=true#/
https://www.bandtogethernc.org/mighty-giveback-24
https://www.signupgenius.com/go/9040C4EABAA23A1FF2-49539935-dayofcaring#/
https://www.signupgenius.com/go/9040C4EABAA23A1FF2-49538779-coffee#/
https://www.signupgenius.com/go/9040C4EABAA23A1FF2-49540476-community#/
mailto:acobb@unitedwaytriangle.org

